BERRYESSA UNION SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID PROPOSAL EQUIPMENT WORKSHEET

BID B-05-2020-21 WIFI EQUIPMENT CATEGORY 2 E-RATE
BIDS DUE MARCH 5, 2021

SUMMARY WORKSHEET / BID RECAP

AAA NETWORK SOLUTIONS | AXCELERATE NETWORKS
QTY |[Model Number Manufacturer |[Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
R730 Indoor wireless
26 |901-R730-US00 Ruckus Access Point $813.60 $21,153.60 $1,249.00 $32,474.00
T750 Outdoor wireless
13 [901-T750-US0O0 Ruckus Access Point $1,677.60 $21,808.80 $2,572.00 $33,436.00
Cloud Wi-Fi
Subscription License for
39 |CLD-RWED5001 Ruckus 5 years (no tax) $146.30 $5,705.70 $150.00 $5,850.00
46 |[ICX-7650-48ZP-E-RMT3 [Ruckus Switch 5GB 48 port $6,667.50 $306,705.00 $10,862.00 $499,652.00
65 |[ICX-7650-48P Ruckus Switch 1GB 48 port $4,431.00 $288,015.00 $7,220.00 $469,300.00
213 |RPS16-E Ruckus AC POE Power Supply $420.00 $89,460.00 $684.00 $145,692.00
186 |[ICX-FAN-12E Ruckus Fan $165.90 $30,857.40 $270.00 $50,220.00
138 |[ICX-7650-4X10GF Ruckus 4-Port Module $420.00 $57,960.00 $684.00 $94,392.00
112 [10G-SFPP-TWX-0301 Ruckus Direct Attach Cable $88.20 $9,878.40 $144.00 $16,128.00
Ruckus CLD 5yr Subs for
111 |CLD-S76M-5001 Ruckus 1 ICX7650 Switch $1,039.50 $115,384.50 $1,066.00 $118,326.00
47 [(PR3000OLCDRTXL2UN CYBERPOWER [UPS $1,033.78 $48,587.66 $1,143.00 $53,721.00
Extended Warranty UPS
47 [WEXT5YR-U4B CYBERPOWER |Years 4,5 (no tax) $173.97 $8,176.59 $190.00 $8,930.00
47 [SMART3000RMXLN TRIPP LITE UPS
2-Year Extended
47 |WEXT2M TRIPP LITE Warranty
47 |5P3000RT EATON UPS
47 |5SW5Y-3000LIC EATON Extended Warranty
SUBTOTOTAL $1,003,692.65|SUBTOTOTAL $1,528,121.00
NO TAX SALES TAX 9.25% $80,884.39(SALES TAX 9.25% $134,033.89
FREIGHT S0.00|FREIGHT $0.00
TOTAL $1,084,577.04|TOTAL $1,662,154.89




BERRYESSA UNION SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID PROPOSAL EQUIPMENT WORKSHEET

BID B-05-2020-21 WIFI EQUIPMENT CATEGORY 2 E-RATE
BIDS DUE MARCH 5, 2021

SUMMARY WORKSHEET / BID RECAP

GIGAKOM IT MGMT
QTY |[Model Number Manufacturer |[Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
R730 Indoor wireless
26 |901-R730-US00 Ruckus Access Point $880.00 $22,880.00 $625.00 $16,250.00
T750 Outdoor wireless
13 |901-T750-US00 Ruckus Access Point $1,812.79 $23,566.27 $1,500.00 $19,500.00
Cloud Wi-Fi
Subscription License for
39 |CLD-RWED5001 Ruckus 5 years (no tax) $160.37 $6,254.43 $133.00 $5,187.00
46 |[ICX-7650-48ZP-E-RMT3 |Ruckus Switch 5GB 48 port $11,510.00f $529,460.00 $5,100.00f $234,600.00
65 |[ICX-7650-48P Ruckus Switch 1GB 48 port $4,759.33| $309,356.45 $3,450.00[ $224,250.00
213 |RPS16-E Ruckus AC POE Power Supply $450.66 $95,990.58 $365.00 $77,745.00
186 |ICX-FAN-12E Ruckus Fan $178.64 $33,227.04 $138.00 $25,668.00
138 |ICX-7650-4X10GF Ruckus 4-Port Module $450.66 $62,191.08 $365.00 $50,370.00
112 |10G-SFPP-TWX-0301 Ruckus Direct Attach Cable $40.60 $4,547.20 $76.00 $8,512.00
Ruckus CLD 5yr Subs for
111 |CLD-S76M-5001 Ruckus 1 1CX7650 Switch $1,141.88| $126,748.68 $800.00 $88,800.00
47 [PR3000LCDRTXL2UN CYBERPOWER |UPS NO BID $939.25 S44,144.75
Extended Warranty UPS
47 |WEXT5YR-U4B CYBERPOWER |Years 4,5 (no tax) NO BID $0.55 $25.85
47 [SMART3000RMXLN TRIPP LITE UPS $1,049.84 $49,342.48
2-Year Extended
47 |WEXT2M TRIPP LITE Warranty $210.49 $9,893.03
47 |5P3000RT EATON UPS
47 |5SW5Y-3000LIC EATON Extended Warranty
SUBTOTOTAL $1,273,457.24|SUBTOTOTAL $795,052.60
NO TAX SALES TAX 9.25% $104,576.90|SALES TAX 9.25% $64,846.18
FREIGHT $675.00|FREIGHT $0.00
TOTAL $1,378,709.14|TOTAL $859,898.78




BERRYESSA UNION SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID PROPOSAL EQUIPMENT WORKSHEET

BID B-05-2020-21 WIFI EQUIPMENT CATEGORY 2 E-RATE
BIDS DUE MARCH 5, 2021

SUMMARY WORKSHEET / BID RECAP

EN-NET SERVICES

QTY (Model Number Manufacturer |[Description Unit Price Total
R730 Indoor wireless
26 [901-R730-US00 Ruckus Access Point NO BID
T750 Outdoor wireless
13 |901-T750-US00 Ruckus Access Point NO BID
Cloud Wi-Fi
Subscription License for
39 |CLD-RWED5001 Ruckus 5 years (no tax) NO BID
46 |[ICX-7650-48ZP-E-RMT3 |Ruckus Switch 5GB 48 port NO BID
65 |ICX-7650-48P Ruckus Switch 1GB 48 port NO BID
213 |RPS16-E Ruckus AC POE Power Supply NO BID
186 |ICX-FAN-12E Ruckus Fan NO BID
138 |ICX-7650-4X10GF Ruckus 4-Port Module NO BID
112 |10G-SFPP-TWX-0301 Ruckus Direct Attach Cable NO BID
Ruckus CLD 5yr Subs for
111 |CLD-S76M-5001 Ruckus 1 1CX7650 Switch NO BID
47 [PR3000LCDRTXL2UN CYBERPOWER |UPS NO BID
Extended Warranty UPS
47 |WEXT5YR-U4B CYBERPOWER |Years 4,5 (no tax) NO BID
47 [SMART3000RMXLN TRIPP LITE UPS
2-Year Extended
47 |WEXT2M TRIPP LITE Warranty
47 |5P3000RT EATON UPS $879.77 $41,349.19
47 |5SW5Y-3000LIC EATON Extended Warranty NO BID
SUBTOTOTAL $41,349.19
NO TAX SALES TAX 9.25% $3,824.80
FREIGHT
TOTAL $45,173.99




